
Act4Earth
Strengthening interface between

SDGs and climate action



COP28 COMPASS
 Road to Dubai and Global Goal on Adaptation

A robust, equitable, and flexible framework on
GGA will be a key determinant of the success of
COP28.

Rooted in CBDR-RC; Link NCQG; Means of
implementation.

IPCC definition of adaptation emphasizes human
and natural systems and not countries. A
paradigm shift in the climate regime is needed
regarding adaptation. Need to revisit the
problem statement.



JETPs need to follow a more holistic approach
that aligns with the existing multilateral climate
finance mechanisms.

Should not add to the debt burden of countries.

Existing JETPs suffer from a lack of
interconnection between the energy demand and
the supply side.

Insufficient focus on R&D and breakthrough
technologies.

COP28 COMPASS
Just Energy Transition Partnerships, Climate

Action and Minilateralism



G20 High-Level Principles on Lifestyles for
Sustainable Development.

SDG 12 indicators can include/have more
downstream indicators.

UNGA resolutions - focus on sustainable
consumption but not in terms of linking
behavioral change.

Agenda item - Article 2 of the UNFCCC

SDG CHARTER
Internationalizing Lifestyles for Sustainable

Development



Locus standi of environment
ministries/departments is limited as much of the
implementation lies with other line
ministries/departments and public agencies..

Essential that environment and cllimate is
mainstreamed across ministries, departments,
and sectors.

Multidimensional model of green budgeting to
contribute to environmentally and climate-
sensitive planning. 

SDG CHARTER
Multidimensional Model of Green Budgeting
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